
As artificial intelligence becomes  
increasingly embedded in both our  
educational systems and the broader world, 
it is essential for educators to understand 
its vast potential as well as the ethical  
concerns surrounding its use. This talk calls 
for AI literacy at every level of the institution, 
aiming to equip higher education  
stakeholders with a deeper understanding 
of AI while critically examining the ethical 
dilemmas that accompany its adoption.  
Attendees will gain insights into Integrating 
AI tools to enhance learning while also  
fostering critical thinking and ethical  
decision-making among students. The  
session will also address strategies for  
guiding  students in the ethical use of AI, 
with a focus on preventing academic  
dishonesty. By the end of this talk,  
participants will be  better prepared to  
navigate the complexities of AI in  
educational settings, ensuring it is used as a 
positive force in both teaching and  
students' learning. 
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